
1TB No,: 

Description: 

For: 

Fund: 

The School Board of Broward County, Florida 
Procurement & Warehousing Services Department 

14-081F

FIRE ALARM SERVICES 

TERM CONTRACT 

PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS 
(School/Department) 

CAPITAL FUNDS 

Tentative Board Meeting Date*: NOVEMBER 12, 2014 

Notified: 5564 Downloaded: 

!TB Rec'd: 5 No Bids: 

1TB Opening: SEPTEMBER 18, 2014 

Advertised Date: JULY 15, 2014 

POSTING OF 1TB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: 1TB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement 

30 

0 

& Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on September 25, 2014 by 4:00PM , and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person 
who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of 
decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a 
notice of protest or failure to file a formal written prote�t shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, 
states that "The fonnal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based." Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays 
and days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall 
be at the office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services Department, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 
33351. Any person who files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a 
bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (I%) of the estimated value of the contract. 
Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute 
a waiver of the right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB, is in effect until this bid is approved by SBBC. The School Board meeting date stated 
above is a tentative date. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded. 

By: 

RECOMMENDATIONfI'ABULATION 

VENDOR'S NAME 

SimplexGiinnell, LP 

Red Hawk Fire & Security, LLC 

Bass-United Fire & Security Systems, Inc 

ITEM(Sl AWARDED 

Group 1 - Simplex Equipment (Main Contract) 

Group 2 - Notifier Equipment (Main Contract) 

Group 3 - FCI Equipment (Main Contract) 

___ _:��;::,;;;S':�d-�::_,..��::::_-=,.L.:::::_ ________ Date:
rchasing Agen ,--

SEPTEMBER 25, 2014 

The School Board of oward Count , Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status,�. reli · n, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158. 

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabllities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (ITY) at 754-321-2158. 

REVISED: 11/22/13 
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Page2 
BID NO. 14-0BIF 

FIRE ALARM SERVICES 

RECOMMENDATION/TABUIATION 

AWARD A CONTRACT TO THE SUCCESSFUL WW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS; 

SIMPLEXGRINNELL, LP FOR GROUP 1 (MAIN CONTRACT) 

RED HAWK FIRE & SECURITI, LLC FOR GROUP 2 (MAIN CONTRACT) 

BASS-UNITED FIRE & SECURITI SYSTEMS, INC. FOR GROUP 3 (MAIN CONTRACT) 

IN ORDER TO MEET THE NEEDS OF THE SCHOOL SYSTEM AND IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE 
SCHOOL BOARD, THE ABOVE ITEMS ARE RECOMMENDED TO BE AWARDED TO THE BIDDERS 
LISTED. 

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT FOR REASONS STATED ON THE BID REJECTION SHEET (BELOW), 
THE BIDS AS STATED, EITHER IN THEIR ENTIRETI OR FOR THE PARTICULAR ITEM(S) LISTED, BE 
REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH BIDS REQUIREMENTS. 

REJECT THE BID RECEIVED FROM SIMPLEXGRINNELL, LP FOR FAILURE TO PROVIDE A 
MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFICATION FOR GROUP 2 - NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT. SECTION 4 - ARTICLE 
10 OF THE INVITATION TO BID STATES "BIDDER MUST HAVE MANUFACTURER CERTIFY THAT 
BIDDER IS AN AUTHORIZED DEALER TO SELL, WARRANTI AND SERVICE THAT 
MANUFACTURER'S PRODUCT. FAILURE TO SUBMIT THE COMPLETED CERTIFICATION WILL 
RESULT IN DISQUALIFICATION OF BID SUBMITTED. A SEPARATE DOCUMENT SHALL BE 
COMPLETED BY EACH MANUFACTURER WHOSE PRODUCT IS OFFERED BY THE BIDDER." 
SIMPLEXGRINNELL, LP DID NOT PROVIDE A MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFICATION FOR GROUP 2 -
NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT. 

REJECT THE BID RECEIVED FROM BASS UNITED FIRE & SECURITI SYSTEMS, INC. FOR FAILURE 
TO PROVIDE A MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFICATION FOR GROUP 2 - NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT. 
SECTION 4 - ARTICLE 10 OF THE INVITATION TO BID STATES "BIDDER MUST HAVE 
MANUFACTURER CERTIFY THAT BIDDER IS AN AUTHORIZED DEALER TO SELL, WARRANTI AND 
SERVICE THAT MANUFACTURER'S PRODUCT. FALURE TO SUBMIT THE COMPLETED 
CERTIFICATION WILL RESULT IN DISQUALIFICATION OF BID SUBMITTED. A SEPARATE 
DOCUMENT SHALL BE COMPLETED BY EACH MANUFACTURER WHOSE PRODUCT IS OFFERED 
BY THE BIDDER." BASS UNITED FIRE & SECURITI SYSTEMS, INC. DID NOT PROVIDE A 
MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFICATION IN THEIR COMPANY'S NAME FOR GROUP 2 - NOTIFIER 
EQUIPMENT. 

REJECT THE BID RECEIVED FROM FRANCIS URIEL ELECTRIC, INC. FOR FAILURE TO PROVIDE A 
MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFICATION FOR GROUP 2 - NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT. SECTION 4 -ARTICLE 
10 OF THE INVITATION TO BID STATES "BIDDER MUST HAVE MANUFACTURER CERTIFY THAT 
BIDDER IS AN AUTHORIZED DEALER TO SELL, WARRANTI AND SERVICE THAT 
MANUFACTURER'S PRODUCT. FALURE TO SUBMIT THE COMPLETED CERTIFICATION WILL 
RESULT IN DISQUALIFICATION OF BID SUBMITTED. A SEPARATE DOCUMENT SHALL BE 
COMPLETED BY EACH MANUFACTURER WHOSE PRODUCT IS OFFERED BY THE BIDDER." 
FRANCIS URIEL ELECTRIC, INC. DID NOT PROVIDE A MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFICATION IN THEIR 
COMPANY'S NAME FOR GROUP 2 - NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT. 

CONTRACT PERIOD; THREE (3) YEARS FROM THE BOARD APPROVAL DATE. 
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DtCI 1'40. 1"1-Ut;fl t" Bid Title: Fire Alarm Services 
Bid Opened: July 15, 2014 

Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Philip D. Kaufold 

� THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 
Bass United Fire & Security Fire Amarm Systems and 

g;:-:� Red Hawk Fire & Securih 

�f 
BID TABULATION SHEET Svstems, Inc. Securitv Francis Uriel Electric Inc. 

Descriotion Quantitv Unit Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

�rouo 1 Simolex Eauioment 
Fire alarm Installer (Work performed between 3:00 

A PM and 12:30 PM) 5,000 Hours No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Fire alarm Technician Rate (Work performed 
B between 3:00PM and 12:30PM) 1,000 Hours No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Fire alarm Installer Rate (Work performed between 
C 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 1,500 Hours No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Fire alarm technician Rate (Work performed 
D between 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 250 Hours No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of SIMPLEX alarm systems for elementary schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 150, to 

E include the required 25% of all heat detectors) 55 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of SIMPLEX alarm systems for middle schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 250, to 

F include the required 25% of all heat detectors) 7 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of SIMPLEX alarm systems for high schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 350, to 

G include the required 25% of all heat detectors) 13 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of SIMPLEX alarm systems for adult/vacation and 
centers (ai.:-erage number of initiating devices is 
350, to include the required 25% of all heat 

H detectors) 13 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total Grouo 1 IA throuah H Inclusive, 

irouo 2 Notifier Equipment 
Fire alarm installer rate (Work performed between 

A 3:00PM and 12:30PM 5,000 Hours $ 49.95 $ 249,750.00 No Bid No Bid $ 140.00 $ 700,000.00 $ 80.00 $ 400,000.00 
Fire alarm technician rate (Work performed 

B between 3:00PM and 12:30PM) 1,000 Hours $ 54.95 $ 54,950.00 No Bid No Bid $ 180.00 $ 180,000.00 $ 100.00 $100,000.00 
Fire alarm installer rate (Work performed between 

C 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 1,500 Hours $ 49.95 $ 74,925.00 No Bid No Bid $ 120.00 $ 180,000.00 $ 68.00 $102,000.00 
Fire alarm technician rate (Work performed 

D between 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 250 Hours $ 49.95 $ 12,487.50 No Bid No Bid $ 125.00 $ 31,250.00 $ 85.00 $ 21,250.00 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of NOTIFIER alarm systems for elementary 
schools (average number of initiating devices is 
150, to include the required 25% of all heat 

E detectors 55 Each $ 1,307.90 $ 71,934.50 No Bid No Bid $ 1,900.00 $ 104,500.00 $1,300.00 $ 71.500.00 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of NOTIFIER alarm systems for middle schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 250, to 

F include the required 25% of alt heat detectors 7 Each $ 2,468.40 $ 17,278.80 No Bid No Bid $ 2,500.00 $ 17,500.00 $2,400.00 $ 16,800.00 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of NOTIFIER alarm systems for high schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 350, to 

G include the required 25% of alt heat detectors "13 Each $ 3,837.90 $ 49,892.70 No Bid No Bid $ 3,100.00 $ 40,300.00 $3,400.00 $ 44.200.00 
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Bid No. 14-081 F Bid Title; Fire Alarm Services Bid Opened: July 15, 2014 

Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Philip O. Kaufold 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of NOTIFIER alarm systems for adultlvocation and 
centers (average number of initiating devices is 
350, to include the required 25% of all heat 

H detectors 13 Each $ 3,568.40 $ 46,389.20 No Bid No Bid $ 3,100.00 $ 40,300.00 $3,400.00 $ 44,200.00 

Total Group 2 (A thro11 ... h H inclusive} $ 577,607.70 $ 1,293,850.00 $799,950.00 

3rouo 3 FCI Eauinment 
Fire alarm Installer (Work performed between 3:00 

A PM and 12:30 PM) 5,000 Hours $ 49.95 $ 249.750.00 $ 60.00 $ 300,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Fire alarm Technician Rate (Work pertormed 

B between 3:00PM and 12:30PM) 1,000 Hours $ 54.95 $ 54,950.00 $ 70.00 $ 70,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Fire alarm Installer Rate (Work pertormed between 
C 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 1,500 Hours $ 49.95 $ 74,925.00 $ 60.00 $ 90,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Fire alarm technician Rate (Work performed 
D between 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 250 Hours $ 49.95 $ 12,487.50 $ 65.00 $ 16,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Sid 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of FCI alarm systems for elementary schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 150, to 

E include the required· 25% of all heat detectors) 55 Each $ 1,307.90 $ 71,934.50 $1,150.00 $ 63,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of FCI alarm systems for middle schools (average 
number of initiating devices is 250, to include the 

F required 25% of all heat detectors 7 Each $ 2,468.40 $ 17,278.80 $2,200.00 $ 15,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of FCI alarm systems tor high schools (average 
number of initiating devices is 350, to include the 

G required 25% of all heat detectors 13 Each $ 3,837.90 $ 49,892.70 
Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 

$3,200.00 $ 41,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

of FCI alarm systems for adult/vocation and 
centers (average number of initiating devices is 
350, to include the required 25% of all heat . 

H detectors 13 Each $ 3,568.40 $ 46,389.20 $3,000.00 $ 39,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total Group 3 (A through H inclusive) $ 577,607.70 $ 635,500.00 
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tilC NO. 14-081 F Bid Title: Fire Alarm Services Bid Opened: July 15, 2014 

Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Philip D. Kaufold 

= THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

�� BID TABULATION SHEET Simplex Grinnell 
-�--- Descriotion Quantitv Unit Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

Grouo 1 Simolex Eauioment $ -

Fire alarm Installer (Work performed between 3:00 
A PM and 12:30 PM) 5,000 Hours $ 112.50 $ 562,500.00 

Fire alann Technician Rate (Work performed 
B between 3:00PM and 12:30PM) 1,000 Hours $ 127 .so $ 127,500.00 

Fire alarm Installer Rate (Work performed between 
C 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 1,500 Hours $ 75.00 $ 112,500.00 

Fire alarm technician Rate (Work performed 
D between 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 250 Hours $ 85.00 $ 21,250.00 

Provide annual testing, inspection and cerfrfication 
of SIMPLEX alarm systems tor elementary schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 150, to 

E include the required 25% of alt heat detectors) 55 Each $ 1,062.58 $ 58,441.90 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of SIMPLEX alarm systems for middle schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 250, to 

F include the required 25% of all heat detectors) 7 Each $ 1,645.88 $ 11,521.16 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of SIMPLEX alann systems for high schools 
{average number of initiating devices is 350, to 

G include the required 25% of all heat detectors) 13 Each $ 2,194.50 $ · 28,528.50 
Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of SIMPLEX alarm systems for adult/vacation and 
centers (average number of initiating devices is 
350, to include the required 25% of all heat 

H detectors) 13 Each $ 2,194.50 $ 28,528.50 
Total Grouc 1 (A throuah H Inclusive\ $ gso,no.os 

Grouo 2 Notifier Eauioment 
Fire alarm installer rate (Work performed between 

A 3:00PM and 12:30PM 5,000 Hours $ 180.00 $ 900,000.00 
Fire alarm technician rate (Work performed 

B between 3:00PM and 12:30PM) 1,000 Hours $ 180.00 $ 180,000.00 
Fire alarm installer rate (Work performed between 

C 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 1,500 Hours $ 125.00 $ 187,500.00 
Fire alarm technician rate (Work performed 

D between 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 250 Hours $ 125.00 $ 31,250.00 
Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of NOTlFJER alarm systems for elementary 
schools (average number of initiating devices is 
150, to include the required 25% of all heat 

E detectors 55 Each $ 1,062.58 $ 58,441.90 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of NOTIFIER alarm systems for middle schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 250, to 

F include the required 25% of alt heat detectors 7 Each $ 1,645.88 $ 11,521.16 
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1::SIO No. 14-081F Bid Title: Fire Alarm Services Bid Opened: July 15, 2014 

Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Philip D. Kaufold 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of NOTIFIER alarm systems for high schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 350, to 

G include the required 25% of all heat detectors 13 Each $ 2,194.50 $ 28,528.50 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of NOTIFIER alarm systems for adult/vocation and 
centers (average number of initiating devices is 
350, to include the required 25'% of all heat 

H detectors 13 Each $ 2,194.50 $ 28,528.50 
Total Group 2 (A through H inclusive) $ 1,425,770.06 

Grouo 3 FCl Eauioment 
Fire alarm Installer (Work performed between 3:00 

A PM and 12:30 PM) 5,000 Hours No Bid No Bid 
Fire alarm Technician Rate (Work performed 

B between 3:00PM and 12:30PM) 1,000 Hours No Bid No Bid 
Fire alarm Installer Rate (Work performed between 

C 7:00AM and 3:00PM) 1,500 Hours No Bid No Bid 
Fire alarm technician Rate (Work performed 

D between 7:00AM and 3·.00PM) 250 Hours No Bid No Bid 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of FCI alarm systems for elementary schools 
(average number of initiating devices is 150, to 

E include the required 25% of all heat detectors) 55 Each No Bid No Bid 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of FCI alarm systems for middle schools (average 
number of initiating devices is 250, to include the 

F required 25% of all heat detectors 7 Each No Bid No Bid 

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of FCI alarm systems for high schools (average 
number of initiating devices is 350, to include the 

G required 25% of all heat detectors . 13 Each No Bid No Bid 
Provide annual testing, inspection and certification 
of FCI alarm systems for adult/vocation and 
centers (average number of initiating devices is 
350, to include the required 25% of all heat 

H detectors 13 Each No Bid No Bid 
Total Group 3 (A through H inclusive) 
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